Bid Tabulation

ITB 18-24

HERBICIDES

Joy McDowell , Principal Buyer

3. MARUBENI AMERICA CORPORATION dba

4. RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, LLC, AN AZELIS

mcdowelljl@ijccal.org 1. HUMPHRIES FARM TURF SUPPLY INC. 2. GREENPOINT AG HOLDINGS LLC HELENA AGRI-ENTERPRISES LLC COMPANY 5. NUTRIEN AG SOLUTIONS, INC.
tem No Descrintion Mfg./Product| Price | Estimated Extended Mfg./Product Price | Estimated | Extended | Mfg./Product Price Estimated Extended Mfg./Product Price | Estimated Extended | Mfg./Product | Price Each|Estimated | Extended
) P No. Each Quantity Price No. Each | Quantity Price No. Each Quantity Price No. Each Quantity Price No. Quantity Price
Grand Tota
ROUNDUP PRO
1 ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE | pyy\pup | 84.95 915 $ 77,7205 BAYER $ 2296| 915 21,008.40 | BAYER 524529 | §  19.31 915 17,668.65 | CONCENTRATE | $  1974| 915 |s 180e210| _BAYER lg  1910| o015 |s$ 1747650
2.5 GAL CONTAINER BAYER 1001168329
ROUNDUP PRO
2 ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE |2y ;np Up pRO| $ 949.79 660 |$ 62686140 BAYER $ 2176 660 14,361.60 [BAYER 5245520 § 1991 | 660 13,140.60 | CONCENTRATE | $  10.24| 660 |$ 12698.40| BAYER- |$ 1860 660 |$ 12,276.00
30 GAL CONTAINER
BAYER 1001168355
ROUNDUP
ROUNDUP PRO DRY, 6.8 LBS MONSANTO QuICK BAYER-
3 CONTAINER NOBID | NOBID 235 NO BID BAYER $125.12 235 29,403.20 520,505 $ 1460| 235 343100 | ppoaver | S 9384 235 |s 220s240f oS s 1380 | 235508 | 2205240
JUG (6.8 LB)
ALLIGARE MILESTONE/ ALLIGARE
4 MILESTONE 2.5 GAL NO BID NO BID 250 NO BID WHETSTONE | $27944 250 69,860.00 | 62719519 |$ 329.00 250 8225000 | “Conreva | $ 32000 250 s e225000| oloootOn |8 265.00 250 $  66,250.00
5 OUST XP, 3.5 LB JUG NO BID NO BID 185 NO BID ALL'G¢§E SMF|'g 2725 185 504125 | 4321552 |$ 2794 | 185 5,168.90 SFM 75 $ 8016 185 |$ 1482060 1(;30?1(6%; . |8 ®20| 18 |s ss87.000
WINFIELD 2,4-D ALLIGARE 2, 4-D
6 HARDBALL 2.5 GAL CONTAINER NO BID NO BID 1275 NO BID AMINE/#184804 - | $ 17.50 1275 22,312.50 5905-594 HAE | $ 37.48 1275 47,787.00 AMINE v $ 13.24 1275 $ 16,881.00 NO BID NO BID 1275 NO BID
2.5 GAL JUGS
ALLIGARE 2, 4-D
7 HARDBALL 265 GAL NO BID NO BID 1500 noBip | WINFIELD24-D 1 o yoa0| 1500 2445000 | s005-549HAE | $  37.23| 1500 5584500 | AMINE(Q75 |$  1294| 1500 |s 1941000 NoBID NO BID 1500 NO BID
CONTAINER AMINE
GALLON TOTE)
SURFACTANT 2.5 GAL WINIFIELD
8 CONTAINER SURFACTANT |$ 39.98 200 s 700600 oot o] § 1698 200 3,396.00 | HAE 5905-50009 | $  18.46 200 3,692.00 NIS $ 1272 200 |$  2544.00 | BREWER90-10| $  11.20 200 |$ 224000
ELITE
9 GROUNDED 2.5 GAL CONTAINER|  NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID II\\IA1/'II’E\‘F'2:ILE)LC?< $ 2160 70 151200 | snozosis | 2150 70 1,505.00 BA’E’T\E/'E‘QRED $ 2472 70 |s  173000| LOVELAND |$ 4750 70 |s 332500
SPECIALTIES
METHOD, 432-
10 PERSPECTIVE 5 LB CONTAINER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100 NO BID 1565 $ 357.12 100 35,712.00 NO BID NO BID 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID 100 NO BID
WINFIELD ROUNDUP ROUNDUP AQUANEAT-
1 RODEO 2.5 GAL CONTAINER NO BID NOBID | NOBID NOBID | CORNERSTONE | $ 19.20 200 3,840.00 | cusTom, 524- | $ 2536 200 5,072.00 $ 2496 200 |s 4,992.00 $ 2420 200 $  4,840.00
54 343 CUSTOM/BAYER NUFARM
REIGN LC QT VS
12 |GROUNDZERO1PINT NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | 460 NOBID |SN0112151116 |$ 935 | 460 430100 | BIPPINGRRSI | g4l 460 |$ 43424000] LoveLanp |s  1350| pinTs, | s 310500
CONTAINER SECURE
(QUARTS) 460/230
RRSI UNAFOAMER-
FOAM BUSTER -
13 DE-FOAMER | ¢ g 75 48 $ az0.00 | WINFIELDFAST | g g0n| 48 30552 | snodozis |$ 824 48 30552 | DeFoamer |$  1200| 48 |s 57600| Lovetano | s 1700| Q7 |s 40800
1 PINT CONTAINER (quart) BREAK 24PT
(QUART) (QUARTS)
MSMA, 2.5 GALLON CONTAINER TARGET 6+
14 MSMA $ 13498| $ 600.00( $ 80,988.00 | DREXEL MSMA | $ 31.20 600 18,720.00 | MSMA, 42519-3 | $ 31.72 600 19,032.00 NO BID NO BID 600 NO BID LUXEMBOURG-| $ 36.00 600 $ 21,600.00
PAMOL
MSMAG6 PLUS TARGET 6+
15 MSMA 265 GAL CONTAINER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID DREXEL $ 30.96 1500 46,440.00 NO BID NO BID 1500 NO BID (275 GALLON $ 31.44 1500 $47,160.00 LUXEMBOURG-| $ 35.50 1500 $ 53,250.00
TOTE) PAMOL
RRSI IVM
SPRAY INDICATOR DYE, 2.5 MARKING BULLSEYE
16 AL TURF MARK | $ 229.98 24 $  551952| ALBAUGH | $ 29.90 24 717.60 | snososis  |[$  37.00 24 888.00 | o ereoriver | § 1642 24 $ 39408 [ oo s |8 5200 24 $ 1,248.00
SPECIALTIES
ALLIGARE ELEMENT 3A-
17 CAPSTONE, 2.5 GAL CONTAINER| ~ NO BID NO BID 250 NO BID TRICLOPYR 35 L | § 4700 250 11,750.00 |  5905-580 |$  89.35 250 2233750 | ELEMENT3A | $  48.40| 250 12, 100.00 coRTEVA |8 4260 250 $  10,650.00
ALLIGARE CHLORSULFURO
18 TELAR 16 OZ BOTTLE NO BID NO BID 60 NO BID CHLORSULFURO| $ 206.72 60 12,403.20 432-1561 $ 282.88 60 16,972.80 N75 $ 216.64 60 12,998.40 BAYER $ 15.40 960 OZ $ 14,784.00
N 75
13.68 DIVERGENCE-
19 OUTRIDER 20 0Z BOTTLE OUTRIDER |$ 489.98 40 $  19,509.20 VALENT $ 266.20 40 10,648.00 |  59639-223,  |07=$273.60/ 40 10,994.00 CRYDER |$ 248.80 40 s 9es200[° Cr T8 1350| 8000z | S 10,800.00
bottle
WINFIELD 2,4-D WEEDAR 64, ALLIGARE 2, 4-D PLATOON-
20 WEEDSTROY, 2, 4-D AMINE, 2.5 | WEEDESTROY | $ 54.98 245 $  13470.10 N $ 17.50 245 4,287.50 T3 |$ 1878 245 4,601.10 AMING $ 1324 245 s s2sss0| TR |8 1440 245 |$ 352800
GAL CONTAINER
21 NO BID NO BID 70 NO BID CORTEVA $ 70.00 70 4,900.00 62719-527 $ 58.12 70 4,068.40 CAPSTONE $ 58.00 70 4, 060.00 CORTEVA $ 58.00 70 $ 4,060.00
CAPSTONE, 2.5 GAL CONTAINER
ALLIGARE ARSENAL
22 POLARIS-2.5 GAL CONTAINER POLARIS |$ 289.90 10 $  2,899.00 $ 74.00 10 740.00 228534  |[$ 6550 10 655.00 | HERBICIDES/ |$  63.82 10 $ 63820 | NUFARM | $ 65.00 10 $  650.00
ECOMAZAPYR BASF
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3. MARUBENI AMERICA CORPORATION dba

4. RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, LLC, AN AZELIS

mcdowelljl@iccal.org 1. HUMPHRIES FARM TURF SUPPLY INC. 2. GREENPOINT AG HOLDINGS LLC HELENA AGRI-ENTERPRISES LLC COMPANY 5. NUTRIEN AG SOLUTIONS, INC.
tem No Descrintion Mfg./Product| Price Estimated Extended Mfg./Product Price | Estimated | Extended | Mfg./Product Price Estimated Extended Mfg./Product Price | Estimated Extended | Mfg./Product | Price Each|Estimated | Extended
) P No. Each Quantity Price No. Each Quantity Price No. Each Quantity Price No. Each Quantity Price No. Quantity Price
ESPLANADE, 2.5 GAL ESPLANADE 200
23 CONTAINER NO BID NO BID 90 NO BID NO BID NO BID 90 NOBID [BAYER 432-1516| $ 1,509.12 90 $ 135,820.80 SC/BAYER $  1,509.12 90 135, 820.80 ENVU $  1,500.12 90 $ 135,820.80
24 IMAZAPIC, 2.5 GAL CONTAINER NO BID NO BID 16 NO BID P:hIE)IISAAI\I:FC $135.50 16 $ 2,168.00 NUFAT;’;;H%B’ $ 12425 16 $ 1,988.00 [PANARAMIC2SL|$  115.78 16 $ 1,852.48 [PLATEAU-BASF| $ 128.00 16 $  2,048.00
TALSTAR P PROFESSIONAL 1 ALBAUGH
25 GAL CONTAINER TALSTAR $ 109.98 12 $ 1,319.76 BIFEN 7.9 $ 4470 12 $ 536.40 | FMC 279-3206 | $ 68.00 12 $ 816.00 NO BID NO BID 12 NO BID FMC $ 48.00 12 $ 576.00
ALLIGARE SFM SFM EXTRA
26 OUST XTRA, 4 LB CONTAINERS NO BID NO BID 100 EXTRA $ 27.85 100 $ 2,785.00 352-622 $ 2794 100 $ 2,794.00 (UG) $ 106.88 100 10, 688.00 BAYER $ 30.50 100 $  3,050.00
ITEM TOTAL 836,802.23 311,676.17 513,035.18 439,276.06 399,624.70
Prices in Red indicate substitution items and/or quantity deviations. See
Red Font  |bid submissions for details.
Purchasing Calculations 836,802.23 311,676.17 497,622.27 216,448.46 | 377,572.30
Delivery is guranteed not later than
days after order date 10-14 7 4 3-5 5
NOTES *Freight costs on all orders under $3,000.00
Notification of Intent to Respond X X X X
Equal Opportunity Certification Form X X X X X
Affidavit of Contractor/E-Verify X X X X X
Non-Collusion Affidavit X X X X X
Debarment Statement X X X X X
Price Sheet X X X X X
PACA Page X X X X X
Signature Page X X X X X
Current Label and Material Safety Sheet X X X X X
Addendum | X X X

Contact Information

1 HUMPHREY'S FARM TURF SUPPLY INC./P.O. BOX 39/JOPPA, AL 35087/CONTACT: AMY BAILEY/P:256-586-8760/E-MAIL: HUMPHRIESTURF@OTELCO.NET

2 GREEN POINT AG HOLDINGS, LLC./5521 EASTCLIFF INDUSTRIAL BLVD./BIRMINGHAM, AL 35210/CONTACT: KYLE SHEHEANE/P: 205-823-1400/E-MAIL: KYLE.SHEHEANE@GREENPOINTAG.COM

3 MARUBENI AMERICA CORPORATION dba HELENA AGRI-ENTERPRISES LLC/3200 OLD MONTGOMERY RD./SELMA, AL 36703/CONTACT: DANIEL RODGERS/C: 662-312-0510/E-MAIL : RODGERSD@HELENAAGRI.COM

4 RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, LLC. AN AZELIS COMPANY/1324 NORTH HEARNE AVE. STE 120/SHREVEPORT. LA 71107/CONTACT: CHAD CHAMBLISS/P: 318-425-5944/E-MAIL: CHAD.CHAMBLISS@AZELIS.COM

5 NUTRIEN AG SOLUTIONS, INC./140 ARKANSAS STREET/MONTICELLO, AR 71655/CONTACT: TIM SMITH/P:870-367-8561
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